
9/11/2012 5-1 
 

CHAPTER 5 
 

CODE ENFORCEMENT 
 
 

PART 1 
 

CREATION OF THE OFFICE OF BUILDING INSPECTOR 
 

§5-101. Creation of the Office of the Building Inspector 
§5-102. Enforcement Authority 
§5-103. Duties and Powers of Building Inspector 
§5-104. Applications for Permits 
§5-105. Conditions of Permits 
§5-106. Notice and Order Procedure 
§5-107. Emergency Measures 
§5-108. Repair/Demolition Order 
§5-109. Stop-Work Order 
§5-110. Violations and Penalties 
§5-111. Code Hearing Board; Variances and Appeals 
 
 

PART 2 
 

BOCA NATIONAL BUILDING CODE 
 

§5-201. Adoption of Building Code 
§5-202. Amendments Made in Building Code 
§5-203. Exclusions 
§5-204. Penalties 
§5-205. State Laws and Regulations 
§5-206. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations 
 
 

PART 3 
 

CABO ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLING CODE 
 

§5-301. Adoption of Dwelling Code 
§5-302. Amendment Made in Dwelling Code 
§5-303. State Laws and Regulations 
§5-304. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations 
 
 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-2 9/11/2012 
 

PART 4 
 

NATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 
 

§5-401. Adoption of Mechanical Code 
§5-402. Amendments Made in Mechanical Code 
§5-403. State Laws and Regulations 
§5-404. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations 
 
 

PART 5 
 

NATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 
 

§5-501. Adoption of Plumbing Code 
§5-502. Amendments Made in Plumbing Code 
§5-503. State Laws and Regulations 
§5-504. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations 
 
 

PART 6 
 

NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE 
 

§5-601. Adoption of Electrical Code 
§5-602. Enforcement 
§5-603. Prohibition Without Permit 
§5-604. Inspection of Work Under Permit 
§5-605. Inspection of Existing Electrical Wiring and Apparatus 
§5-606. Approved Materials 
§5-607. Supplements 
§5-608. Modification on Application 
§5-609. Exemption 
§5-610. Penalties 
§5-611. State Laws and Regulations 
§5-612. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations 
 
 

PART 7 
 

BOCA NATIONAL FIRE PREVENTION CODE 
 

§5-701. Adoption of Fire Prevention Code 
§5-702. Amendments Made in Fire Prevention Code 
§5-703. State Laws and Regulations 
§5-704. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations 
 
 



9/11/2012 5-3 
 

PART 8 
 

INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE 
 

§5-801. Adoption of International Property Maintenance Code 
§5-802. Amendments and Revisions 
§5-803. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed 
§5-804. Savings Clause 
 
 

PART 9 
 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 
 

§5-901. Election to Enforce the Pennsylvania Construction Code Act 
§5-902. Adoption of the Building Code 
§5-903. Administration and Enforcement Provisions 
§5-904. Building Code Board of Appeals 
§5-905. Existing Ordinances 
§5-906. Changes to the Code 
§5-907. Fee Schedule 
§5-908. Changes to the Amendable Sections of the Labor and Industry Regulations 
§5-909. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed 
§5-910. Saving Clause 
 
 

PART 10 
 

CERTAIN LICENSES REQUIRED 
 
§5-1001. License and Fee Required for Plumbers Working Within the Township. 
 
 





  (5, PART 1) 
 

9/11/2012 5-5 
 

PART 1 
 

CREATION OF THE OFFICE OF BUILDING INSPECTOR 
 

 
§5-101. Creation of the Office of the Building Inspector. 
 
There is hereby created by the East Rockhill Township Board of Supervisors an office of 
the Township of East Rockhill, to be known as the “Office of the Building Inspector.” 
The official appointed thereto by the Board of Supervisors shall have the responsibility 
for administration and enforcement of the provisions of this Part and other codes and/or 
ordinances of the Township of East Rockhill, herein referred to as the “applicable codes 
and ordinances,” which designate the Office of the Building Inspector as their official 
administrative and enforcement authority. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. I) 
 
 
§5-102. Enforcement Authority. 
 
1. Appointment of Building Inspector. There shall be appointed, by the Board of Su-

pervisors of East Rockhill Township, a Building Inspector, who shall be in charge 
of the Office of the Building Inspector of the Township of East Rockhill. 

 
2. Approved Inspection Agencies. The Building Inspector shall make all the required 

inspections or may accept reports or inspections by authoritative and recognized 
inspections agencies or individuals which satisfy requirements as to qualifications 
and reliability. All inspection reports shall be in writing and shall be certified by 
the approved authority or responsible officer of the agency or the individual when 
expert inspection services are accepted. The Building Inspector may engage such 
expert opinion as may be deemed necessary to report upon unusual technical is-
sues that may arise subject to the approval of the Board of Supervisors. When re-
quired by the provisions of the code or by the approved rules, materials or assem-
blies shall be inspected at the point of manufacture or fabrication. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. 1) 
 
 
§5-103. Duties and Powers of Building Inspector. 
 
1. Enforcement of Codes. The Building Inspector shall enforce and administer all of 

the provisions of this Part and of those other applicable codes and ordinances 
which establish the Office of the Building Inspector as their official administra-
tion and enforcement authority. 

 
2. Duties. The duties of the Building Inspector shall include: 
 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-6 9/11/2012 
 

 A. The receipt of applications and issuance of permits for the erection, addition 
to, alteration, repair, removal, demolition, and installation of service equip-
ment (plumbing, electrical, mechanical) and structures. 

 
 B. The issuance of all necessary notices and orders to abate illegal or unsafe 

conditions to ensure compliance with this Part and those other codes and/or 
ordinance for the safety, health and general welfare of the public. 

 
 C. The making of inspections to determine compliance with the applicable 

codes and ordinances. 
 
 D. The undertaking of investigations and other activities as may be required. 
 
3. Official Records. The Building Inspector shall keep an official record of all busi-

ness and activities, and all such records shall be open to the public for inspection 
at all appropriate times, except that no individual, owner, owner/operator, occu-
pant or other person shall be subject to unwarranted invasion of privacy, and ex-
cept that all evidence or information shall not be disclosed except as may be nec-
essary in the judgment of the Building Inspector for the proper and effective ad-
ministration and enforcement of the provisions of this chapter. 

 
4. Preliminary Inspections. Before issuing a permit, the Building Inspector may ex-

amine or cause to be examined all buildings, structures and sites for which an ap-
plication has been filed for a permit to construct, enlarge, alter, repair, remove, 
demolish or change the use thereof. 

 
5. Required Inspections. After issuing a permit, the Building Inspector or designated 

inspection agency shall conduct such required inspections from time to time dur-
ing and upon completion of the work for which a permit has been issued. A record 
of all such examinations and inspections and of all violations of this code shall be 
maintained by the Building Inspector. Upon completion of the building or struc-
ture and before the issuance of the certificate of use and occupancy, a final inspec-
tion shall be made and all violations of the approved plans and permits shall be 
abated. No new building or portion of any existing building which is enlarged or 
altered shall be used or occupied, in whole or in part, until such certificate of use 
and occupancy shall have been issued by the Building Inspector. Required inspec-
tions shall be as follows: 

 
 A. Building. 
 
  (1) Footing and setback: to be made after trenches or basement areas are 

excavated and forms erected and any required reinforcement steel is 
in place and prior to placing concrete. 

 
  (2) Foundation walls: to be made after parging and tamp proofing is in 

place and prior to backfilling. 
 



  (5, PART 1) 
 

9/11/2012 5-7 
 

  (3) Framing: to be made after the roof, all framing, fire stopping and brac-
ing are in place and prior to interior covering. 

 
 B. Electrical. 
 
  (1) Service: prior to power company connection. 
 
  (2) Rough wire: prior to covering. 
 
  (3) Final: prior to occupancy. 
 

 The above inspections are to be made by listed electrical inspection agencies 
as approved by the Township under this chapter. 

 
 C. Plumbing. 
 
  (1) Under slab: prior to pouring concrete. 
 
  (2) Rough in: prior to covering. 
 
  (3) Final: prior to occupancy. 
 
 D. Other Inspections. 
 
 E. Accounting. The Building Inspector shall keep an accurate account of all 

fees collected, and such collected fees shall be deposited in the Township 
Treasury or otherwise disposed of as required by law. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. 1) 
 
 
§5-104. Applications for Permits. 
 
1. When Permit is Required. 
 
 A. Construction Permit. This type of permit shall be issued for all new con-

struction on vacant land or land where a building was demolished in prepa-
ration for construction or where construction adds to the livable area of a 
residence or additional floor area of a commercial building. Fees shall be 
fixed from time to time pursuant to a resolution of the Board of Supervisors. 

 
 B. Alteration Permit. This type of permit shall be issued when, in the opinion 

of the Building Inspector, the work involved does not increase the livable 
area of the residence or the floor area of a commercial building and is not 
considered to be normal maintenance or repairs. Any change in size, shape, 
height, type of materials, etc., necessitates an alteration permit. Fees shall 
be fixed from time to time by the Board of Supervisors pursuant to a resolu-
tion. 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-8 9/11/2012 
 

 
 C. Garage Permit. This type of permit shall be issued for the construction of 

private garages when either detached from the dwelling or connected by a 
breezeway. The fee shall be fixed from time to time by the Board of Supervi-
sors pursuant to a resolution. 

 
 D. Demolition Permits. This type of permit shall be issued for the wrecking of a 

building. The fee shall be fixed from time to time by the Board of Supervi-
sors pursuant to a resolution. No fee shall be charged when removal of the 
building has been ordered by the Building Inspector. 

 
2. Where work, for which a permit is required by the code, is started or proceeded 

with prior to obtaining said permit, the fee shall be increased by 25%, but pay-
ment of such increased fee shall not relieve any person from fully complying with 
the requirements of the code and the execution of the work nor from any penalties 
prescribed by the code. 

 
3. Forms of Application. The application for a permit shall be submitted in such form 

as the Building Inspector may prescribe and shall be accompanied by the required 
fee pursuant to the fee schedule. 

 
4. By Whom Application is Made. The responsibility for applying for and obtaining a 

required permit rests jointly with the owner or occupant and the person or per-
sons doing the work. The full name and address of the owner, lessee, applicant 
and/or the responsible officers, if the owner or lessee is a corporate body, shall be 
stated in the application. 

 
5. Description of Work. The application shall contain a general description of the 

proposed work, its location, the use and occupancy of all parts of the building or 
structure and of all portions of the site or lot not covered by the building or struc-
ture and such additional information as may be required by the Building Inspec-
tor. 

 
6. Plans and Specifications. The application for the permit shall be accompanied by 

one copy of specifications and of plans, drawn to scale, with sufficient clarity and 
detailed dimension to show the nature and character of the work performed. 
When quality of materials is essential for conformity to the codes, specific infor-
mation shall be given to establish such quality, and the code shall not be cited or 
the term “legal” or its equivalent be used as a substitute for specific information. 
The Building Inspector may waive the requirement for filing plans when the work 
involved is of a minor nature. If, in the course of the work, it is found necessary to 
make any changes from the approved plans and specifications on which a permit 
has been issued, amended plans and specifications shall be submitted and, if ap-
proved, a supplementary permit shall be issued to cover the change after the same 
conditions required to secure the original permit have been satisfied. 

 
7. Site Plan. There shall also be a site plan showing, to scale, the size and location of 

all the new construction and all existing structures and the site distances from lot 



  (5, PART 1) 
 

9/11/2012 5-9 
 

lines, the established street grades and the proposed finished grades, and it shall 
be drawn in accordance with an accurate boundary line survey. In the case of 
demolition, the plot plan shall show all construction to be demolished and the lo-
cation and size of all existing structures, and the plan shall show the location of 
water service and sewer connections with respect to any building in which a 
plumbing system is to be installed. Vent stack terminations shall be shown with 
respect to building ventilation openings which could allow introduction of sewer 
gases into the building or any adjacent building. 

 
8. Engineering Details. The Building Inspector may require adequate details of 

structural, mechanical, plumbing and electrical work to be filed, including compu-
tations, stress diagrams and other essential technical data. All engineering plans 
and computations shall bear the signature of the engineer or architect responsible 
for the design. Plans for building more than two stories in height shall indicate 
where penetrations will be made for electrical, mechanical, plumbing and commu-
nications conduits, pipes and systems and the materials and methods for main-
taining the required structural integrity, fire-resistance rate and fire-stopping. 

 
9. Other Permits Required. At the time of filing an application for a permit, the ap-

plicant shall present to the Building Inspector evidence that he has obtained all 
necessary permits, licenses, approvals and/or variances as may be required by the 
laws of the Township and the commonwealth. 

 
10. Action on Application. The Building Inspector shall examine said application to 

determine compliance with those other applicable codes and ordinances of the 
Township and shall, within 30 days after filing, either approve or reject said ap-
plication. If said application is rejected, the Building Inspector shall inform the 
applicant in writing, stating the reasons for such rejection. If the Building Inspec-
tor is satisfied that the proposed work conforms to the requirements of the appli-
cable codes, the Building Inspector shall issue a permit therefor as soon as possi-
ble. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. I) 
 
 
§5-105. Conditions of Permits. 
 
1. Compliance with Codes. The permit shall be a license to proceed with the work 

and shall not be construed as authority to violate, cancel or set aside the applica-
tion. All work shall conform to the approved application and plans for which the 
permit has been issued and any approved amendments thereto. 

 
2. Signature on Permit. The Building Inspector’s signature shall be attached to eve-

ry permit, or the Building Inspector may authorize a subordinate to affix such 
signature thereof. 

 
3. Payment of Fees. A permit to begin work shall not be issued until the permit pre-

scribed by resolution adopted by the Board of Supervisors has been paid, nor shall 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-10 9/11/2012 
 

an amendment to a permit necessitating an additional fee because of additional 
work involved be issued until the additional fee shall have been paid. 

 
4. Previous Approvals. This Part or the applicable codes shall not require changes in 

the plans, the plumbing, electrical, or mechanical system, or the construction or 
designated use of a building for which a lawful permit has been issued or other-
wise lawfully authorized and the construction of which has been actively prose-
cuted within 90 days after the effective date of this Part and which is completed 
with dispatch. 

 
5. Approvals in Part. The Building Inspector may issue permits for the construction 

of foundations or any other part of a building or structure before the entire plans 
and specifications for the whole building or structure have been submitted, pro-
vided that adequate information and detailed statements have been filed comply-
ing with all the pertinent requirements of the codes. The holder of such permits 
shall proceed at the holder’s own risk with the building operation and without as-
surance that permits for the entire structure will be granted. 

 
6. Permit Expiration Dates. 
 
 A. New construction: one year, provided that an extension may be requested, in 

writing, and such extension may be granted by the Building Inspector for 
good reason; such extension not to exceed one year. 

 
 B. Repairs, remodeling, alterations and additions: one year. 
 
 C. Demolition: three months only; and if such demolition work is not completed 

within that time, any bond posted by the applicant shall be forfeited. 
 
 D. Abate violations cited: same as deadline stated in violation notice. 
 
7. Revocation of Permits. The Building Inspector may revoke a permit or approval 

issued under the provisions of the codes in case of any mistake, or false statement, 
or misrepresentation of fact in the application or on the plans on which the permit 
or approval was based. 

 
8. Posting of Permit. A true copy of the building permit and placard shall be kept on 

the site of operations open to public inspection during the entire time of prosecu-
tion of the work and until the completion of the same. 

 
9. Notice of Inspection. At least 24 hours’ notice in advance for required inspections 

indicated on the permit shall be given to the Building Inspector or certified in-
spection agency. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. I) 
 
 



  (5, PART 1) 
 

9/11/2012 5-11 
 

§5-106. Notice and Order Procedure. 
 
1. Notice to Responsible Owner, Operator, Occupant or Other Person in Charge. 

Whenever the Building Inspector determines that there are reasonable grounds to 
believe that there has been a violation of any provisions of this Part or of the other 
applicable codes and ordinances, or whenever the Building Inspector orders a 
dangerous, unsafe or unfit for human habitation structure to be closed up and se-
cured, vacated, repaired and/or demolished, a notice shall be given to the respon-
sible owner, operator, occupant or person in charge of the structure or premises in 
the manner prescribed below. 

 
2. Form. Notice to the responsible owner, operator, occupant or person in charge 

shall include the following: 
 
 A. Be in writing, signed by the Building Inspector or his authorized repre-

sentative. 
 
 B. Include a description of the real estate sufficient for identification. 
 
 C. Include a statement of the reasons why the notice is being issued, the sec-

tions of this Part and/or ordinances which have been violated. 
 
 D. Include a correction order allowing a reasonable time, not to exceed 120 

days, for the initiation and correction of the violation alleged or of the reme-
dial actions required, except where emergency conditions exist which re-
quire immediate correction action. 

 
 E. Include a statement indicating that the notice will become an order if no re-

quest and approval of an extension of time is made to the Building Inspector 
or if no petition for an appeal or hearing is requested by the owner to seek 
modification before the Code Hearing Board within 10 days after receipt of 
said notice. 

 
3. Service. The notice shall be served personally on the responsible owner, occupant, 

operator or other person in charge or served by certified mail with a return receipt 
requested, or where such responsible person in charge cannot be found, service 
may be made by posting a notice on or about the structure or premises and taking 
a picture of said notice, or by publishing said notice in a newspaper of general cir-
culation for a period of three consecutive days, or served by any other method au-
thorized under the laws of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. I) 
 
 
§5-107. Emergency Measures. 
 
1. Vacation of Structures. When, in the opinion of the Building Inspector, an emer-

gency exists on any premises or in the structure or part thereof, or in any defec-



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-12 9/11/2012 
 

tive equipment (plumbing, electrical, mechanical), which requires immediate ac-
tion to protect the public’s health and safety or that of the occupants thereof, or if 
there is actual and immediate danger of failure or collapse of a building or struc-
ture or any part thereof, or when any structure or part of a structure has fallen 
and life is endangered by the occupancy of the building or structure, the Building 
Inspector may, with proper notice and service, issue an order reciting the exist-
ence of such an emergency and requiring the vacating of the premises or such ac-
tion taken as the Building Inspector deems necessary to meet such emergency. 
Notwithstanding other provisions of this Part, such order shall be effective imme-
diately, and the premises or equipment involved shall be placarded immediately 
upon service of the order. Any person to whom such order is directed shall comply 
immediately therewith and may thereafter, upon petition directed to the Code 
Hearing Board, be afforded a hearing as prescribed in this Part. 

 
2. Temporary Safeguards. When, in the opinion of the Building Inspector, there is 

actual and immediate danger of collapse or failure of a building or structure or 
part thereof, he shall require said building or structure or part thereof to be made 
temporarily safe, whether or not the legal procedure herein described has been in-
stituted. 

 
3. Closing Streets. When necessary for the public safety, the Building Inspector may 

temporarily close sidewalks, streets, buildings, and structures and places adjacent 
to such unsafe structures and prohibit the same from being used. It shall be un-
lawful for any person to enter such building or structure except for the purpose of 
making the required repairs or demolishing the same. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. I) 
 
 
§5-108. Repair/Demolition Order. 
 
1. General. The Building Inspector shall make periodic inspections of any structure 

vacated as unfit for human habitation or any vacant structure. 
 
2. Option by Owner. If a structure is so old, deteriorated or has become so out of re-

pair as to be unsanitary or unfit for human habitation, but can be made safe by 
repairs, the Building Inspector may issue a notice requiring the owner to make 
the necessary repairs to bring the structure into compliance with the Township 
codes and/or ordinances or to demolish and remove the structure at the owner’s 
option. Such notice shall require the person this notified to immediately disclose 
to the Building Inspector his acceptance or rejection of the terms of the order. 

 
3. Unreasonable Repairs. Whenever an inspection of a structure reveals that the 

structure is old, dilapidated or has become so out of repair as to be dangerous, un-
safe, unsanitary or otherwise unfit for human habitation, occupancy or use and so 
that it would be unreasonable to repair, in that the cost of such repairs would ex-
ceed 100% of the current value of such structure, the structure shall be declared a 
public nuisance. The Building Inspector shall issue a notice to the responsible 



  (5, PART 1) 
 

9/11/2012 5-13 
 

owner, ordering that the structure be removed or demolished without option on 
the part of the owner to repair. All the rubbish and refuse shall be removed from 
the premises and the cellar/basement shall be filled in with clean fill, compacted 
and graded to adjacent ground level. 

 
4. Service Connection. Before a structure can be demolished or removed, the owner 

or agent shall notify all utilities having service connections with the structure, 
such as water, electric, gas, sewer and other connections. A permit to demolish or 
remove a structure shall not be issued until a release is obtained from the utili-
ties, stating that their respective service connections and appurtenant equipment, 
such as meters and regulators, have been removed or sealed and plugged in a safe 
manner. 

 
5. Notice to Adjoining Owners. Only when written notice has been given by the ap-

plicant to the owners of adjoining lots and to the owners of wires or other facili-
ties, of which the temporary removal may be necessitated by the proposed work, 
shall a permit be granted for removal of a building or structure. 

 
6. Determination of Building Inspector. In the event that the owner or agent is una-

ble to obtain the releases, the Building Inspector shall inspect the premises for 
which application has been made, to determine that the utility service connections 
and appurtenant equipment have been removed or sealed and plugged in a safe 
manner. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. I) 
 
 
§5-109. Stop-Work Order. 
 
1. Notice to the Owner. Whenever the Building Inspector determines that work on 

any building or structure is being prosecuted contrary to the provisions of the ap-
plicable codes and/or ordinances in an unsafe and dangerous manner, the respon-
sible owner of the property doing the work shall be notified that such work be 
immediately stopped. 

 
2. Unlawful Continuance. Any person who shall continue any work in or about the 

structure after having been served with a stop-work order, except such work as is 
directed to be performed to remove a violation or unsafe conditions, shall be sub-
ject to the penalties provided by this Part. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. I) 
 
 
§5-110. Violations and Penalties. 
 
1. Unlawful Acts. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, 

construct, alter, repair, remove, demolish, use or occupy any building or structure 
or plumbing, electrical, or mechanical equipment and fire-suppression system 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-14 9/11/2012 
 

regulated by this Part and/or the applicable codes and ordinances, or cause same 
to be done, in conflict with or in violation of any of the provisions of this Part 
and/or the applicable codes and ordinances. 

 
2. Occupancy Without Use and Occupancy Certificate. Any new building hereafter 

erected for which a building permit was issued shall not be used or occupied in 
whole or in part until a certificate of use and occupancy shall have been issued by 
the Building Inspector. Notice of this requirement shall be given to each recipient 
of a building permit, and failure to secure a use and occupancy certificate before 
use or occupancy of a building is subject to immediate fine and costs as prescribed 
in this Part. No further notification as required under this Part shall be required. 
The building owner, by signing the building permit, agrees not to violate any pro-
vision of the Township codes and/or ordinances and is so notified. The use and oc-
cupancy certificate is a license to occupy and use the building. 

 
3. Failure to Comply. Whenever an order to vacate, secure, repair and/or demolish a 

structure which is a public nuisance because it is unsafe, dangerous or unfit for 
human habitation has not been complied with, the Building Inspector may, in ac-
cordance with the laws of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, proceed to cause 
the structure to be vacated, closed up, and secured, repaired and/or demolished or 
take such other action as is necessary to abate the nuisance. Abatement under 
this subsection shall not commence until at least 10 days after the service of the 
order, except that the Building Inspector may determine that more-immediate ac-
tion is required because of the special emergency or dangerous conditions which 
exist. 

 
4. Recovery of Expenses. The expenses incurred pursuant to Subsection 3 of this sec-

tion and other applicable sections of this Part and other codes and ordinances 
shall be paid by the responsible owner, operator or occupant or by the persons who 
caused or maintained such public nuisance. The Building Inspector shall file in 
his records an affidavit, stating with fairness and accuracy the items and date of 
the expenses incurred. The Board of Supervisors may institute a suit to recover 
such expenses to be charged against the property as a lien or against the person 
or legal entity violating the code as a judgment. 

 
5. Transfer of Ownership. It shall be unlawful for the owner of any dwelling unit or 

structure who has received a compliance order or upon whom a notice of violation 
has been served to sell, transfer, mortgage, lease or otherwise dispose of to anoth-
er until the provisions of the compliance order or notice of violation have been 
complied with or until such owner shall furnish the grantee, transferee, mortga-
gee or lessee a true copy of any compliance order or notice of violation issued by 
the Building Inspector and shall furnish to the Building Inspector a signed and 
notarized statement of the grantee, transferee, mortgagee or lessee acknowledging 
the receipt of such compliance order or notice of violation and fully accepting the 
responsibility without condition for making the corrections or repairs required by 
such compliance order or notice of violation. 

 



  (5, PART 1) 
 

9/11/2012 5-15 
 

6. Penalties. Any person, firm or corporation who shall violate any provisions of this 
Part or who fails to correct a violation or institute a remedial action as ordered by 
the Building Inspector or who shall erect, construct, install, alter or repair a build-
ing, structure or any plumbing, electrical and mechanical equipment or systems in 
violation of an approved plan or directive of the Building Inspector or of a permit 
or certificate issued under the provisions of the Township codes shall, upon con-
viction thereof in an action brought before a District Justice in the manner pro-
vided for the enforcement of summary offenses under the Pennsylvania Rules of 
Criminal Procedure, shall be sentenced to pay a fine of not more than $1,000 plus 
costs and, in default of payment of said fine and costs, to a term of imprisonment 
not to exceed 90 days. 

 
7. Prosecution. The imposition of the penalties herein prescribed shall not preclude 

the Solicitor representing the Township from initiating, and he is hereby ordered 
to initiate, appropriate actions or proceedings at law or equity for the purpose of 
ordering that person: 

 
 A. To restrain, correct or remove the violation or refrain from any further exe-

cution of work. 
 
 B. To restrain or correct the erection, installation or alteration of such struc-

ture. 
 
 C. To require the removal of work in violation. 
 
 D. To prevent the occupation or use of the structure or part thereof erected, 

constructed, installed or altered in violation of, or not in compliance with, 
the provisions of this code or in violation of a plan or specification under an 
approval, permit or certificate which was issued. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. I; as amended by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-111. Code Hearing Board; Variances and Appeals. 
 
1. Code Hearing Board. There is hereby established a Code Hearing Board consist-

ing of the three members of the East Rockhill Township Board of Supervisors. 
 
2. Powers of the Code Hearing Board. The Code Hearing Board shall have the fol-

lowing powers and duties: 
 
 A. Appeals. The Code Hearing Board shall hear all appeals made to it and, de-

pending on its findings, shall decide whether relief sought in such appeals 
shall be granted. 

 
 B. Interpretation. The Code Hearing Board shall hear all appeals made to it 

and, depending on its findings, shall decide whether relief sought in such 
appeals shall be granted. 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-16 9/11/2012 
 

 
 C. Variances. The Code Hearing Board may grant a variance from the strict 

application of this Part or subsequent Parts of this chapter. Such variances 
may be granted only in those cases which would result in practical difficulty 
or unnecessary hardship and where the public health and safety shall not be 
jeopardized. 

 
 D. Decision of the Board. A decision to affirm, modify or reverse the decision of 

the Building Inspector shall be made by a majority of those present and sit-
ting as the Code Hearing Board in any specific case. The Board shall also re-
tain in its files a copy of each decision, which files shall be available for in-
spection by the public. Each decision shall set forth fully the reason for the 
decision of the Code Hearing Board and the findings of fact on which the de-
cision was based. 

 
 E. Enforcement of Decision. The Code Hearing Board shall make an order on 

its decision, and the Building Inspector shall take immediate action in ac-
cordance with the decision of the Board, to carry out said order. 

 
3. Request for Appeals or Variances. 
 
 A. Appeals or Variances. Any person requesting a variance or aggrieved by a 

decision of the Building Inspector or by an other employee or official charged 
with the administration and enforcement of this Part may, upon petition, 
appeal to the Code Healing Board. All appeals shall be made in writing, 
stating the grounds upon which the appeal is based, and shall be filed with 
the Office of the Building Inspector. An appeal must be taken within 10 
days of action or of the receipt of written notice of any decision or ruling 
which is being appealed. Appeal fees shall be fixed from time to time by the 
Board of Supervisors pursuant to a resolution. 

 
 B. Public Hearing. The Code Hearing Board shall meet and conduct a hearing 

within 30 days of the receipt of a petition for an appeal or request for a vari-
ance. All hearings shall be public, and all persons whose interest may be af-
fected shall be given an opportunity to be heard. Hearings shall be conduct-
ed in accordance with the Local Agency Law, 2 Pa.C.S.A. §105 et seq. 

 
 C. Court Review. Any person or persons aggrieved by any final order or deci-

sion of the Code Hearing Board may appeal such order or decision within 30 
days to the Court of Common Pleas in accordance with, as far as practicable, 
the rules of civil procedure of the Supreme Court regarding appeals from 
administrative agencies. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. I) 



  (5, PART 2) 
 

9/11/2012 5-17 
 

PART 2 
 

BOCA NATIONAL BUILDING CODE 
 

 
§5-201. Adoption of Building Code. 
 
East Rockhill Township hereby adopts, for the purpose of establishing rules and regula-
tions for the construction, alteration, equipment, fire protection and safety of buildings 
and structures, including administration, building permits and penalties, the building 
code known as the “BOCA National Building Code, Eleventh Edition, 1990,” save and 
except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified or amended, and the same is 
hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein. From the date 
on which this Part shall take effect, the provisions thereof shall be controlling in the 
construction of all buildings and structures, and in all other subjects therein contained, 
within East Rockhill Township. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. II) 
 
 
§5-202. Amendments Made in Building Code. 
 
The Building Code hereby adopted is amended as follows: 
 
 A. “East Rockhill Township” shall be inserted wherever the words “name of 

municipality” appear in brackets therein. Whenever the term “legal officer” 
or “legal representative” is used in this Part, it shall be held to mean the 
East Rockhill Township Solicitor. 

 
 B. Section 109.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  §109.1. Building Inspector. The Office of Building Inspector is hereby creat-

ed, and the executive official in charge shall be known as the “Building In-
spector.” 

 
 C. Section 109.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  §109.2. Appointment. The Building Inspector shall be appointed by the 

Board of Supervisors of East Rockhill Township. His appointment shall con-
tinue during good behavior and satisfactory service. 

 
 D. Section 109.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  §109.4. Deputy. During temporary absence or disability of the Building In-

spector, the appointing authority shall designate an Acting Building Inspec-
tor. 

 
 E. Section 111.6 is amended to add §§111.6.2, 111.6.3 and 111.6.4 as follows: 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-18 9/11/2012 
 

 
  (1) §111.6.2. Erosion and Sedimentation Control Plan. 
 
   An erosion and sedimentation control plan shall be submitted with all 

applications wherein excavation, placement of fill and/or grading ac-
tivities are proposed. The plan shall include a construction staging 
narrative indicating the sequence of earthmoving activities and pro-
posed erosion and sedimentation control procedures. Measures used to 
control erosion and reduce sedimentation during construction activi-
ties shall conform to the standards and specifications of the Bucks 
County Conservation District. At a minimum, the following measures 
shall be included where applicable: 

 
   (a) Stripping of vegetation, regrading or other activities shall be 

done in a way that will minimize erosion and resulting sedimen-
tation. 

 
   (b) Cut and fill operations shall be kept to a minimum. Wherever 

feasible, natural vegetation shall be retained, protected and 
supplemented. 

 
   (c) All erosion and sedimentation control measures shall be in-

stalled per the approved plan prior to any earthmoving activi-
ties. 

 
   (d) The disturbed earthen area and the duration of exposure shall 

be kept to a practical minimum but shall not exceed 20 days. All 
disturbed soils and topsoil stockpile areas shall be stabilized as 
quickly as possible and, if necessary, seeded with temporary 
vegetation and mulched. If stockpile areas are located on sloping 
ground or near waters of the commonwealth, same shall be en-
closed with silt fencing. 

 
   (e) Permanent vegetation shall be installed as soon as practical on 

all sites. 
 
   (f) All runoff from project areas shall be collected and diverted to 

facilities for removal of sediment. 
 
   (g) Runoff from a project area shall not be discharged into the wa-

ters of the commonwealth without means to prevent sedimenta-
tion. 

 
   (h) Sedimentation in the runoff water shall be trapped and filtered 

until the disturbed area is stabilized by the use of debris basins, 
sediment basins, silt traps or similar measures. 

 



  (5, PART 2) 
 

9/11/2012 5-19 
 

   (i) Sediment barriers shall be properly installed with silt fencing 
trenched and hay bales staked. 

 
   (j) Tire-cleaning areas constructed of PennDOT No. 4 stone and at 

least 50 feet in length shall provided at each point of access to 
the lot. 

 
   (k) During construction activities, necessary measures for dust con-

trol must be exercised. 
 
   (l) It shall be the responsibility of each person, corporation or other 

entity performing grading and/or building activities to install 
and maintain erosion and sedimentation controls until the site 
is stabilized. In the event any mud and/or debris is transported 
from the site onto a public roadway, the debris shall be removed 
and the roadway swept and/or washed as deemed necessary by 
the Township at the owner’s expense. 

 
  (2) §111.6.3. Grading Plans. 
 
   Applications for building permits wherein excavation, placement of fill 

and/or grading activities are proposed on any residential lot less than 
50,000 square feet in area, all nonresidential applications, and all ap-
plications for any residential lot where, in the opinion of the Building 
Inspector, lot features such as slope, soils or other natural features 
require special consideration of on-lot grading, shall be accompanied 
by a site plan providing the following information: 

 
   (a) A plot plan prepared by an engineer or surveyor licensed in the 

Commonwealth of Pennsylvania showing the proposed and ex-
isting topography of the site; all existing improvements to the 
site; dimensions, first-floor elevations and setbacks from proper-
ty lines for all existing and proposed buildings; and location of 
all existing and proposed wells, waterlines, utility lines, septic 
systems, sewer lines, storm sewers, sump pump drains, ease-
ments, trees to be removed, trees to remain, etc. The plan shall 
bear the imprint of the responsible licensed engineer or survey-
or. 

 
   (b) Plot plans shall include sufficient off-site topographic infor-

mation to determine the impact of any off-site runoff draining 
onto or through the property. 

 
   (c) A statement signed and sealed by a licensed engineer indicating 

that, to the best of his/her knowledge and belief, the proposed 
grading activities shall not significantly increase runoff to, 
and/or otherwise adversely impact, downstream properties ex-



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-20 9/11/2012 
 

cept as may be part of an approved stormwater runoff collection 
and management plan. 

 
  (3) §111.6.4. Site Plan Review. 
 
   (a) The site plan shall be reviewed by the Building Inspector and 

shall conform in every respect to the approved subdivision 
and/or land development plan for the site. If, in the opinion of 
the Building Inspector, the proposed grading activities do not 
conform to previously approved plans, the application shall be 
referred to the Township Engineer for review. 

 
   (b) In the event the Township Engineer determines that the pro-

posed grading activities do not conform to previously approved 
drawings, issuance of the building permit shall not occur unless 
and until the revised grading plan is reviewed and approved by 
the Board of Supervisors. 

 
 F. Section 113.0, Conditions of Permit, is hereby amended to add the following 

subsections: 
 
  (1) §131.6. First-Floor Certification. 
 
   Prior to approval to commence with construction of any new dwelling 

or nonresidential building, the owner/builder shall submit certifica-
tion that the first-floor elevation of the proposed structure conforms to 
the site plan. The certification shall be submitted to the Township 
Building Inspector on a form approved by the Township. 

 
  (2) §113.7. General Grading Requirements. 
 
   All building construction wherein excavation, placement of fill and/or 

grading activities are performed shall conform to the following general 
requirements: 

 
   (a) No excavation or fill shall be made with a face steeper than 

three horizontal to one vertical, except under one or both of the 
following conditions: 

 
    1) The material is sufficiently stable to sustain a steeper 

slope. A written statement to that effect from a civil engi-
neer licensed in the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania and 
experienced in erosion control shall be submitted to the 
Building Inspector. The statement shall affirm that the 
site has been inspected and the deviation from the slope 
restriction shall not result in injury to persons or damage 
to property. A detail of the treatment of the slope (pro-



  (5, PART 2) 
 

9/11/2012 5-21 
 

posed grade, seeding, erosion protection, etc.) shall be 
submitted with the application. 

 
    2) A concrete, masonry or other approved retaining wall con-

structed in accordance with approved standards is provid-
ed to support the face of the excavation or fill. 

 
   (b) Edges of slopes shall be a minimum of five feet from property 

lines or right-of-way lines of streets in order to permit the nor-
mal rounding of the edge without encroachment on abutting 
property. 

 
   (c) Adequate provision shall be made to prevent surface water from 

damaging the cut face of an excavation and the sloping surfaces 
of fills. 

 
   (d) No person, corporation or other such entity shall block, impede 

the flow of, alter, construct any structure, or deposit any mate-
rial or thing or perform any work that will affect the normal or 
flood flow in any stream or watercourse without having obtained 
prior approval from the Township and/or Department of Envi-
ronmental Protection, whichever is applicable. 

 
   (e) All lots, tracts or parcels shall be graded to provide positive 

drainage away from buildings and dispose of it without ponding, 
except where ponding (detention basins, swales, etc.) is part of 
the stormwater management plan for the site. 

 
   (f) Concentration of surface water runoff shall be permitted only in 

swales, watercourses or detention basins. 
 
   (g) All plans wherein a sump pump or basement drain is proposed 

to be installed shall provided for discharge of the sump 
pump/drain to a natural watercourse, drainage swale, storm-
water easement or storm sewer system. 

 
   (h) Each person, corporation or other entity which makes any sur-

face changes shall be required to: 
 
    1) Collect on-site surface runoff and control it to a point of 

discharge into the natural watercourse of the drainage ar-
ea, stormwater easement or storm sewer system. 

 
    2) Control existing off-site runoff drainage through the prop-

erty by designing it to discharge to the natural water-
course of the drainage area, stormwater easement or 
storm sewer system. 

 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-22 9/11/2012 
 

   (i) In no case shall grading be done in such a manner as to divert 
water onto the property of another landowner unless part of a 
stormwater management plan. 

 
   (j) During grading operations, necessary measures for dust control 

must be exercised. 
 
   (k) No grading equipment shall be permitted to be loaded and/or 

unloaded on a public street, and no grading equipment shall be 
permitted to travel on or across a public street unless licensed 
for operation on public thoroughfares. 

 
   (l) Grading equipment shall not be permitted to cross live streams. 

Temporary crossing shall only be permitted where application is 
made, and approval received, from the DEP (where applicable) 
and East Rockhill Township. 

 
 G. Section 113.8 is hereby revised and amended to read as follows: 
 
  §113.8. As-Built Drawings. 
 
  (1) For all applications required to prepare a site plan in accordance with 

§111.6.1, as-built plans indicating compliance with the site plan shall 
be prepared by a licensed surveyor or engineer and submitted to the 
Township prior to issuance of a use and occupancy permit. In the 
event the site grading does not conform to the approved site plan, the 
applicant shall either regrade the site to conform to the plan or submit 
an as-built plan to the Township Supervisors for review and approval. 

 
  (2) No use and occupancy of the structure constructed pursuant to the 

building permit shall be permitted until the final grading is approved 
by the Township. In the event that the structure constructed is sub-
stantially completed as certified by the Building Inspector, but the fi-
nal grading, seeding, paving or other on-lot improvements are unable 
to be completed due to weather or other compelling reasons, a use and 
occupancy permit for the structure may be issued; provided that the 
applicant or proposed occupant posts financial security in an amount 
deemed sufficient by the Township to guarantee the final completion 
of all incomplete grading, seeding, paving or other on-lot improve-
ments not finally done at the time of occupancy. The amount of finan-
cial security for such conditional occupancy shall be set by the Board 
of Supervisors by separate resolution. 

 
 H. Section 114.3.1. shall be amended to read as follows: 
 
  §114.3.1. Fee Schedule. The fees charged by East Rockhill Township for 

building-related activities in the issuance of permits shall be as established 
by East Rockhill Township from time to time by separate resolution. 



  (5, PART 2) 
 

9/11/2012 5-23 
 

 
 I. Section 117.4 shall be amended to read as follows: 
 
  §117.4. Violation Penalties. Any person, copartnership or corporation in vio-

lation of any of the provisions of this Part or of the Building Code hereby 
adopted, upon conviction thereof in an action brought before a District Jus-
tice in the manner provided for the enforcement of summary offenses under 
the Pennsylvania Rules of Criminal Procedure, shall be sentenced to pay a 
fine of not more than $1,000 plus costs and, in default of payment of said fi-
ne and costs, to a term of imprisonment not to exceed 90 days.  

 
 J. §118.2. Unlawful Continuance. 
 
  (1) Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure af-

ter having been served with a stop-work order pursuant to this Part or 
to any other ordinance of East Rockhill Township, except such work as 
that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe con-
dition, shall, upon conviction thereof in an action brought before a 
District Justice in the manner provided for the enforcement of sum-
mary offenses under the Pennsylvania Rules of Criminal Procedure, 
be sentenced to a fine not exceeding $1,000 plus costs and, in default 
of payment of said fine and costs, to a term of imprisonment not to ex-
ceed 90 days. 

 
  (2) The application of the above penalties shall not be held to prevent the 

enforced removal of prohibited conditions by an action at law or in eq-
uity instituted by the Township of East Rockhill. 

 
 K. Section 123.0 is hereby deleted. 
 
 L. Section 2906.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  §2906.1. Filing Bond. No person shall erect, install, remove or rehang any 

sign for which a permit is required under the provisions of the basic code 
until an approved bond shall have been filed in the sum to be determined by 
resolution. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. II; as amended by Ord. 149, 4/20/1993, Art. I; and by Ord. 192, 
4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-203. Exclusions. 
 
Exempted from the provisions of the code shall be accessory prefabricated buildings or 
structures which do not house people or animals and which are erected on site or deliv-
ered erected to the site and installed without masonry or pole-type foundation below 
ground surface and not exceeding 100 square feet. 
 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-24 9/11/2012 
 

(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. II) 
 
 
§5-204. Penalties. 
 
1. Any person, firm or corporation who shall violate any provision of this Part, upon 

conviction thereof in an action brought before a District Justice in the manner 
provided for the enforcement of summary offenses under the Pennsylvania Rules 
of Criminal Procedure, shall be sentenced to pay a fine of not more than $1,000 
plus costs and, in default of payment of said fine and costs, to a term of imprison-
ment not to exceed 90 days. Each day that a violation of the Part continues or 
each section of this Part which shall be found to have been violated shall consti-
tute a separate offense. 

 
2. The application of the above penalties shall not be held to prevent the enforced 

removal of prohibited conditions by an action at law or in equity instituted by the 
Township of East Rockhill. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. II; as amended by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-205. State Laws and Regulations. 
 
In all matters that are regulated by the laws of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania or 
by regulations of departments or agencies of the commonwealth promulgated by author-
ity of law, such laws or regulations, as the case may be, shall be controlling where the 
requirements thereof are the same as or more limiting than the provisions of this Part. 
The foregoing codes shall control in all cases where the state requirements are not as 
strict as those contained in this Part. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. II; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-206. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations. 
 
The provisions of this Part, so far as they are the same as those of ordinances and/or 
codes in force immediately prior to the enactment of this Part, are intended as a contin-
uation of such ordinances and codes and not as new enactments. The provisions of this 
Part shall not affect any act done or liability incurred, nor shall they affect any suit or 
prosecution pending or to be instituted to enforce any right or penalty or to punish any 
offense, under the authority of any of the repealed ordinances. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. II; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 



  (5, PART 3) 
 

9/11/2012 5-25 
 

PART 3 
 

CABO ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLING CODE 
 

 
§5-301. Adoption of Dwelling Code. 
 
The Township of East Rockhill hereby adopts, for the purpose of establishing rules and 
regulations for the fabrication, erection, construction, reconstruction, enlargement, al-
teration, addition to, repair, location and use of detached one- and two-family dwellings, 
their appurtenances and accessory structures, the one- and two-family dwelling code 
known as the “CABO One- and Two-Family Dwelling Code, 1989 Edition,” of which 
three copies have been and now are filed in the office of the Township Secretary, and the 
same is adopted and incorporated as if fully set out at length herein. From the date by 
which this Part shall take effect, the provisions thereof shall be controlling in the fabri-
cation, erection, construction, reconstruction, enlargement, alteration, addition to, re-
pair, location and use of detached one- and two-family dwellings, their appurtenances 
and accessory structures within the corporate limits of the Township of East Rockhill. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. III) 
 
 
§5-302. Amendment Made in Dwelling Code. 
 
The dwelling code hereby adopted is amended as follows: 
 
 A. Section R-106, last paragraph, now reads: “Any person, firm or corporation 

who shall violate any provision of this Part, upon conviction thereof in an 
action brought before a District Justice in the manner provided for the en-
forcement of summary offenses under the Pennsylvania Rules of Criminal 
Procedure, shall be sentenced to pay a fine of not more than $1,000 plus 
costs and, in default of payment of said fine and costs, to a term of impris-
onment not to exceed 90 days. Each day that a violation of this Part contin-
ues or each section of this Part that shall be found to have been violated 
shall constitute a separate offense.” 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. III; as amended by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-303. State Laws and Regulations. 
 
In all matters that are regulated by the laws of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania or 
by regulations of departments or agencies of the commonwealth promulgated by author-
ity of law, such laws or regulations, as the case may be, shall be controlling where the 
requirements thereof are the same as or more limiting than the provisions of this Part. 
The foregoing codes shall control in all cases where the state requirements are not as 
strict as those contained in this Part. 
 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-26 9/11/2012 
 

(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. III; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-304. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations. 
 
The provisions of this Part, so far as they are the same as those of ordinances and/or 
codes in force immediately prior to the enactment of this Part, are intended as a contin-
uation of such ordinances and codes and not as new enactments. The provisions of this 
Part shall not affect any act done or liability incurred, nor shall they affect any suit or 
prosecution pending or to be instituted to enforce any right or penalty or to punish any 
offense, under the authority of any of the repealed ordinances. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. III; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 



  (5, PART 4) 
 

9/11/2012 5-27 
 

PART 4 
 

NATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 
 

 
§5-401. Adoption of Mechanical Code. 
 
The Township of East Rockhill hereby adopts, for the purpose of prescribing regulations 
governing the safe installation and maintenance of all mechanical equipment, the me-
chanical code known as the “BOCA National Mechanical Code, 1990, Seventh Edition,” 
save and except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified or amended, and the 
same is hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein. From the 
date hereinafter stated when this Part shall take effect, the provisions thereof shall be 
controlling within the boundaries of East Rockhill Township. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. IV) 
 
 
§5-402. Amendments Made in Mechanical Code. 
 
The mechanical code hereby adopted is amended as follows: 
 
 A. “East Rockhill Township” shall be inserted wherever the words “name of 

municipality” appear in brackets therein. 
 
 B. Whenever the term “legal officer” or “legal representative” is used in this 

code, it shall be held to mean the East Rockhill Township Solicitor. 
 
 C. Sections M-114.2 and Section M-114.3 are hereby amended to reflect that 

the fee schedule containing the appropriate filing fees for applications filed 
hereunder shall be prescribed by East Rockhill Township by separate fee 
resolution. 

 
 D. Section M-117.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  M-177.4. Penalties for Violations. 
 
  (1) Any person who shall violate any provision of the mechanical code, for 

each and every violation, upon conviction thereof in an action brought 
before a District Justice in the manner provided for the enforcement of 
summary offenses under the Pennsylvania Rules of Criminal Proce-
dure, shall be sentenced to pay a fine of not more than $1,000 plus 
costs and, in default of payment of said fine and costs, to a term of im-
prisonment not to exceed 90 days. 

 
  (2) The application of the above penalties shall not be held to prevent the 

enforced removal of prohibited conditions by an action at law or in eq-
uity instituted by the Township of East Rockhill. 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-28 9/11/2012 
 

 
 E. Section M-118.2 shall be deleted. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. IV; as amended by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-403. State Laws and Regulations. 
 
In all matters that are regulated by the laws of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania or 
by regulations of departments or agencies of the commonwealth promulgated by author-
ity of law, such laws or regulations, as the case may be, shall be controlling where the 
requirements thereof are the same as or more limiting than the provisions of this Part. 
The foregoing codes shall control in all cases where the state requirements are not as 
strict as those contained in this Part. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. IV; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-404. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations. 
 
The provisions of this Part, so far as they are the same as those of ordinances and/or 
codes in force immediately prior to the enactment of this Part, are intended as a contin-
uation of such ordinances and codes and not as new enactments. The provisions of this 
Part shall not affect any act done or liability incurred, nor shall they affect any suit or 
prosecution pending or to be instituted to enforce any right or penalty or to punish any 
offense, under the authority of any of the repealed ordinances. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. IV; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 



  (5, PART 5) 
 

9/11/2012 5-29 
 

PART 5 
 

NATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 
 

 
§5-501. Adoption of Plumbing Code. 
 
East Rockhill Township hereby adopts, for the purpose of establishing rules and regula-
tions for the design and installation of plumbing systems, including administration, 
plumbing permits and penalties, the plumbing code known as the “BOCA National 
Plumbing Code, 1990, Eighth Edition,” save and except such portions as are hereinafter 
deleted, modified or amended, and the same is hereby adopted and incorporated as fully 
as if set out at length herein; and from the date on which this Part shall take effect, the 
provisions thereof shall be controlling in the design and installation of plumbing sys-
tems within East Rockhill Township. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. V) 
 
 
§5-502. Amendments Made in Plumbing Code. 
 
The plumbing code hereby adopted is amended as follows: 
 
 A. “East Rockhill Township” shall be inserted wherever the words “name of 

municipality” appear in brackets therein. Whenever the term “legal officer” 
or “legal representative” is used in this Part, it shall be held to mean the 
East Rockhill Township Solicitor. 

 
 B. Section P-100.4 is hereby added as follows: 
 
  §P-100.4. Effective Date. This Part shall take effect on March 24, 1991. 
 
 C. Section P-104.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  §P-104.1. Continuation. The legal use and occupancy of any structure exist-

ing on March 30, 1991, or for which it had been heretofore approved, may be 
continued without change except as may be specifically covered in this Part 
or deemed necessary by the plumbing official for the general safety and wel-
fare of the occupants and the public. 

 
 D. Section 114.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-30 9/11/2012 
 

  §114.2. Fee Schedule. For approving plans and issuing a permit therefor, to 
include inspection and the work during its progress and for final inspection 
and supervision of the rest of the work to be made by the plumber on plumb-
ing installations, the administrative authority shall be entitled to receive fil-
ing fees and permit fees as shall be established from time to time by East 
Rockhill Township by separate fee resolution. 

 
 E. Section 117.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  §P-117.4. Violation Penalties. Any person, copartnership or corporation in 

violation of any of the provisions of this Part hereby adopted, upon convic-
tion thereof in an action brought before a District Justice in the manner 
provided for the enforcement of summary offenses under the Pennsylvania 
Rules of Criminal Procedure, shall be sentenced to pay a fine of not more 
than $1,000 plus costs and, in default of payment of said fine and costs, to a 
term of imprisonment not to exceed 90 days. 

 
 F. Section 118.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  §P-118.2. Unlawful Continuance. 
 
  (1) Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure af-

ter having been served with a stop-work order pursuant to this Part or 
to any other ordinance of East Rockhill Township, except such work as 
that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe con-
dition, upon conviction thereof in an action brought before a District 
Justice in the manner provided for the enforcement of summary of-
fenses under the Pennsylvania Rules of Criminal Procedure, shall be 
sentenced to pay a fine of not more than $1,000 plus costs and, in de-
fault of payment of said fine and costs, to a term of imprisonment not 
to exceed 90 days. 

 
  (2) The application of the above penalties shall not be held to prevent the 

enforced removal of prohibited conditions by an action at law or in eq-
uity instituted by the Township of East Rockhill. 

 
 G. Section P-201.0 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  §P-201.0. Administrative Authority. The person appointed by the Township 

of East Rockhill to the position of Building Inspector with authority to ad-
minister and enforce the provisions of this Part. 

 
 H. Section P-303.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  §P-303.2. Public Systems Available. A public water supply system or public 

sewer system shall be deemed available to premises used for human occu-
pancy if such premises are within 150 feet, measured along a street, alley or 
easement, of the public water supply or sewer system and a connection con-



  (5, PART 5) 
 

9/11/2012 5-31 
 

forming with the standards set forth in this Part may be made thereto. This 
provision, however, shall be superseded by any separate ordinance of East 
Rockhill Township concerning public water supply systems or public sewer 
systems and more particularly the Zoning Ordinance [Chapter 27]. 

 
 I. Section P-308.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  §P-308.3. Freezing. Water service piping and sewers shall be installed below 

recorded frost penetration but not less than three feet below grade for water 
piping and three feet below grade for sewers. Plumbing piping in exterior 
building walls shall be adequately protected against freezing by insulation 
or heat, or both. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. V; as amended by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-503. State Laws and Regulations. 
 
In all matters that are regulated by the laws of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania or 
by regulations of departments or agencies of the commonwealth promulgated by author-
ity of law, such laws or regulations, as the case may be, shall be controlling where the 
requirements thereof are the same as or more limiting than the provision of this Part. 
The foregoing codes shall control in all cases where the state requirements are not as 
strict as those contained in this Part. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. V; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-504. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations. 
 
The provisions of this Part, so far as they are the same as those of ordinances and/or 
codes in force immediately prior to the enactment of this Part, are intended as a contin-
uation of such ordinances and codes and not as new enactments. The provisions of this 
Part shall not affect any act done or liability incurred, nor shall they affect any suit or 
prosecution pending or to be instituted to enforce any right or penalty or to punish any 
offense, under the authority of any of the repealed ordinances. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. V; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 





  (5, PART 6) 
 

9/11/2012 5-33 
 

PART 6 
 

NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE 
 

 
§5-601. Adoption of Electrical Code. 
 
East Rockhill Township hereby adopts, for the purpose of establishing rules and regula-
tions for the installation, renewal, extension and reception of electric wiring and electric 
apparatus in existing buildings, structures, or outdoor electrical displays or signs, or in 
the construction, reconstruction, alteration or repair of buildings, structures or outdoor 
electrical displays or signs, the electrical code known as the “National Electrical Code, 
1990 Edition,” as recommended by the National Fire Protection Association, and the 
same is hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out in length herein. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI) 
 
 
§5-602. Enforcement. 
 
The National Electrical Code adopted in §5-601 of this Part shall be enforced by the 
Building Inspector or his or her designate (hereinafter jointly referred to as “Building 
Inspector”). The Building Inspector shall, upon the installation, removal, extension and 
reception of any electrical wiring and electric apparatus pursuant to this Part, cause an 
inspection or inspections to be made by himself or his duly authorized agents, to deter-
mine that the electrical work conforms with the National Electrical Code, this Part and 
other ordinances of East Rockhill Township and the statutes of the Commonwealth of 
Pennsylvania. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI) 
 
 
§5-603. Prohibition Without Permit. 
 
No person, copartnership, firm, association, corporation or other legal entity shall here-
after install, receive, renew or extend electrical wire or conductors to be used for the 
transmission of electric current for electric light, heat or power purposes in existing 
buildings, structures or outdoor electrical displays or signs or in the construction, recon-
struction, alteration or repair of buildings, structures or outdoor electrical displays or 
signs without first applying for and obtaining a permit to do so pursuant to this Part. 
 
 A. All such applications for a permit shall be made to the Building Inspector in 

writing on forms supplied by said Building Inspector. 
 
 B. Any person making false answers to any questions or items set forth in such 

application forms shall forfeit and surrender any permit issued pursuant 
thereto. 

 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-34 9/11/2012 
 

 C. Such application form shall contain questions designed to elicit information 
to determine whether or not said proposed electric wiring and electric appa-
ratus comply with the National Electrical Code, any other ordinances of the 
East Rockhill Township and statutes of the Commonwealth of Pennsylva-
nia. 

 
 D. Each such application form shall be accompanied by a fee prescribed by the 

East Rockhill Township fee schedule resolution in effect at the time of filing. 
 
 E. Each applicant for a permit shall furnish to the Building Inspector proof in 

writing that an application for inspection of the proposed electric wiring and 
electric apparatus has been made to a local area inspection agency that spe-
cializes in such inspections to determine that the electrical work conforms 
with the provisions of the National Electrical Code and this Part. The pay-
ment of all inspection fees and charges of the local area inspection agency 
shall be borne by the applicant. 

 
 F. Each applicant for a permit shall cause the premises covered by the applica-

tion to be open for inspection or inspections by the Building Inspector and 
his agents and the representative or representatives of the local area inspec-
tion agency at all reasonable times. 

 
 G. Upon the Building Inspector’s determination that the proposed electric wir-

ing and electric apparatus comply with the National Electric Code, this Part 
and other ordinances of the East Rockhill Township and the statutes of the 
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, a permit shall be issued. 

 
 H. All permits shall expire one year from the date of issuance by the Building 

Inspector. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI) 
 
 
§5-604. Inspection of Work Under Permit. 
 
1. All inspections shall be made to ensure that the proposed electrical work complies 

with the National Electric Code. No electric wiring shall be concealed unless in-
spected and approved by the Building Inspector and his agents and the represent-
atives or representative of the local area inspection agency, but such inspection or 
reinspection shall be made within a reasonable time after notice of completion of 
the electrical work sought to be inspected for approval. A duplicate record of each 
written approval made by the local area inspection agency shall be filed with the 
Building Inspector. 

 
2. All decisions made to determine whether or not the proposed electrical work com-

plies with the provisions of the National Electrical Code shall be made by the 
Building Inspector. 

 



  (5, PART 6) 
 

9/11/2012 5-35 
 

3. The Building Inspector shall have the power to stop electrical work and order the 
removal thereof when he determines that such work is being installed not in con-
formity with the National Electrical Code, this Part and other ordinances of East 
Rockhill Township and the statutes of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania. 

 
4. The Building Inspector may waive his inspection to determine compliance with 

the National Electrical Code and this Part of all or that portion of the proposed 
electrical work for which he shall have received a duplicate record of approval by 
the local area inspection agency. The Building Inspector shall give notice so that 
the approved work can be concealed. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI) 
 
 
§5-605. Inspection of Existing Electrical Wiring and Apparatus. 
 
In order to safeguard persons and property against the hazards and perils incident to 
defective electric wiring and apparatus that are or may not be in existence within the 
corporate limits of East Rockhill Township, the Building Inspector is hereby given the 
power and authority to inspect, with his agents and the representative or representa-
tives of the local area inspection agency, when requested by proper authority or when 
public interest so requires, any premises within East Rockhill Township at reasonable 
times to ensure that the existing electric wiring system and apparatus is not defective 
and unsafe. 
 
 A. All decisions that the existing electric wiring system and apparatus is defec-

tive shall be made by the Building Inspector in writing, on notice to the 
owner of the premises served forthwith personally or by regular mail ad-
dressed to the address shown on the latest tax records, with reasons for his 
decision. 

 
 B. Upon the Building Inspector’s decision that the existing electric wiring sys-

tem is defective and unsafe as aforesaid, the system or portions of the sys-
tem which are defective and unsafe shall be discontinued until it is correct-
ed and made to comply with provisions of the National Electrical Code in 
accordance with this Part. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI) 
 
 
§5-606. Approved Materials. 
 
Only the materials, fittings and devices enumerated in the “List of Inspected Applianc-
es” of Underwriters’ Laboratories, Inc., as revised from time to time, shall be used in the 
electrical work regulated by the National Electrical Code and this Part. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI) 
 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-36 9/11/2012 
 

 
§5-607. Supplements. 
 
The National Electrical Code herein adopted is supplemented by adding thereto the fol-
lowing, which is made a part hereof: 
 
 A. Whenever a permit is required under the terms of this Part for electrical 

wiring and apparatus to be done in connection with a gas or oil burner in-
stallation in any existing building or structure or in the structures, there 
shall be installed an emergency shutoff switch with a red plate thereon 
marked “oil burner” or “gas burner,” as the case may be, at the entrance to 
the basement or heating room. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI) 
 
 
§5-608. Modification on Application. 
 
The Building Inspector shall have the power to modify any of the provisions of this Part, 
upon application in writing by the owner of a premises or his agent, when there are 
practical difficulties in the way of carrying out the strict letter of this Part, provided 
that the spirit of this Part shall be observed, public safety secured and substantial jus-
tice done. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI) 
 
 
§5-609. Exemption. 
 
No permit shall be required under this Part for the following electrical work: 
 
 A. Minor repair work such as the replacement of lamps and fuses. 
 
 B. The connection of portable electrical appliances to suitable permanently in-

stalled appliances. 
 
 C. Equipment installed or work performed by or for a public utility operating 

under authority granted by the Pennsylvania Public Utility Commission of 
the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania. 

 
 D. Equipment installed or work performed by a railway utility in the exercise 

of its function as a utility in or on its right-of-way. 
 
 E. Equipment used in connection with commercial radio and television trans-

mission. 
 



  (5, PART 6) 
 

9/11/2012 5-37 
 

 F. Repair manufacturing and maintenance work on premises occupied by a 
firm or corporation and performed by a regular employee who is a qualified 
journeyman electrician. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI) 
 
 
§5-610. Penalties. 
 
1. Any person who shall violate any provision of the Electrical Code, for each and 

every violation, upon conviction thereof in an action brought before a District Jus-
tice in the manner provided for the enforcement of summary offenses under the 
Pennsylvania Rules of Criminal Procedure, shall be sentenced to pay a fine of not 
more than $1,000 plus costs and, in default of payment of said fine and costs, to a 
term of imprisonment not to exceed 90 days. 

 
2. The application of the above penalties shall not be held to prevent the enforced 

removal of prohibited conditions by an action at law or in equity instituted by the 
Township of East Rockhill. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI; as amended by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-611. State Laws and Regulations. 
 
In all matters that are regulated by the laws of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania or 
by regulations of departments or agencies of the commonwealth promulgated by author-
ity of law, such laws or regulations, as the case may be, shall be controlling where the 
requirements thereof are the same as or more limiting than the provisions of this Part. 
The foregoing codes shall control in all cases where the state requirements are not as 
strict as those contained in this Part. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-612. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations. 
 
The provisions of this Part, so far as they are the same as those of ordinances and/or 
codes in force immediately prior to the enactment of this Part, are intended as a contin-
uation of such ordinances and codes and not as new enactments. The provisions of this 
Part shall not affect any act done or liability incurred, nor shall they affect any suit or 
prosecution pending or to be instituted to enforce any right or penalty or to punish any 
offense, under the authority of any of the repealed ordinances. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VI; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 





  (5, PART 7) 
 

9/11/2012 5-39 
 

PART 7 
 

BOCA NATIONAL FIRE PREVENTION CODE 
 

 
§5-701. Adoption of Fire Prevention Code. 
 
The East Rockhill Township hereby adopts, for the purpose of prescribing regulations 
governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire or explosion, the fire pre-
vention code as the known as the “BOCA National Fire Prevention Code, 1990, Eighth 
Edition,” save and except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified or amended, 
and the same is hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein. 
From the date hereinafter stated when this Part shall take effect, the provisions thereof 
shall be controlling within the boundaries of East Rockhill Township. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VII) 
 
 
§5-702. Amendments Made in Fire Prevention Code. 
 
The fire prevention code hereby adopted is amended as follows: 
 
 A. “East Rockhill Township” shall be inserted wherever the words “name of 

municipality” appear in brackets. 
 
 B. Wherever the term “legal officer” or “legal representative” is used in this 

Part, it shall be held to mean the East Rockhill Township Solicitor. 
 
 C. Penalties. 
 
  (1) Any person who shall violate any provision of the Fire Prevention 

Code, for each and every violation, upon conviction thereof in an ac-
tion brought before a District Justice in the manner provided for the 
enforcement of summary offenses under the Pennsylvania Rules of 
Criminal Procedure, shall be sentenced to pay a fine of not more than 
$1,000 plus costs and, in default of payment of said fine and costs, to a 
term of imprisonment not to exceed 90 days. 

 
  (2) The application of the above penalties shall not be held to prevent the 

enforced removal of prohibited conditions by an action at law or in eq-
uity instituted by the Township of East Rockhill. 

 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VII; as amended by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-40 9/11/2012 
 

§5-703. State Laws and Regulations. 
 
In all matters that are regulated by the laws of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania or 
by regulations of departments or agencies of the commonwealth promulgated by author-
ity of law, such laws or regulations, as the case may be, shall be controlling where the 
requirements thereof are the same as or more limiting than the provisions of this Part. 
The foregoing codes shall control in all cases where the state requirements are not as 
strict as those contained in this Part. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VII; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 
 
§5-704. Provisions to be Continuation of Existing Regulations. 
 
The provisions of this Part, so far as they are the same as those of ordinances and/or 
codes in force immediately prior to the enactment of this Part, are intended as a contin-
uation of such ordinances and codes and not as new enactments. The provisions of this 
Part shall not affect any act done or liability incurred, nor shall they affect any suit or 
prosecution pending or to be instituted to enforce any right or penalty or to punish any 
offense, under the authority of any of the repealed ordinances. 
 
(Ord. 136, 3/24/1991, Art. VII; as added by Ord. 192, 4/18/2000) 
 



  (5, PART 8) 
 

9/11/2012 5-41 
 

PART 8 
 

INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE 
 

 
§5-801. Adoption of International Property Maintenance Code. 
 
The 2003 International Property Maintenance Code, as published by the International 
Code Council, Inc., be and is hereby adopted as the Property Maintenance Code of the 
Township of East Rockhill, for the control of building and structures as herein provided; 
and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said 
International Property Maintenance Code are hereby adopted and made a part hereof 
as if fully set out in this Part, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes pre-
scribed in §5-802 of this Part. 
 
(Ord. 207, 6/15/2004, §1) 
 
 
§5-802. Amendments and Revisions. 
 
The following sections are hereby revised: 
 
 A. Section 101.1. Insert: “Township of East Rockhill.” 
 
 B. Section 103.5. Insert: “East Rockhill Township Fee Schedule.” 
 
 C. Section 111.2 is hereby amended to reflect that all appeals under the Prop-

erty Maintenance Code shall be made to and heard by the Appeals Board 
appointed pursuant to the UCC. 

 
 D. Sections 111.2.1, 111.2.2, 111.2.3, 111.2.4, and 111.2.5 shall be deleted. 
 
 E. Section 302.4. Insert: “six inches.” 
 
 F. Section 302.4. Add the following sentence at the end of first paragraph: 

“This section shall apply to within 200 feet of any habitable or occupiable 
structures or buildings.” 

 
 G. Section 304.14. Insert: “May 1 to November 1, where appropriate.” 
 
 H. Section 304.3, Premises Identification, shall be amended to read as follows: 
 
  The Township shall have final authority as to the assignment of a street 

number or address for each structure. Each structure to which a street 
number has been assigned by the Township shall have the appropriate 
number displayed in a location and size as to be readily observed and read-
able from the closest public right-of-way. All street numbers shall be in Ara-
bic characters at a minimum of six inches in height and 1/2 inch wide 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-42 9/11/2012 
 

stroke. Structures that are set back more than 50 feet from the public right-
of-way, or any distance when the number can not be readily seen from the 
right-of-way, shall have the assigned street numbers attached to a post or 
mailbox placed at the end of the driveway on the same side of the road as 
the structure is located. These numbers shall be at least four inches in 
height with 1/2 inch wide strokes and shall be placed on both sides of the 
post or mailbox at a minimum height of three feet so as numbers can be 
seen by vehicles traveling from either direction. All street numbers shall be 
illuminated when possible and shall be colored in contrast with the back-
ground upon which the number is placed. 

 
  No street numbers may be painted upon any public curbs, streets, signs, 

posts, or sidewalks, without prior written approval of the Township. Any 
resident wishing to display a street address upon the public curbline, may 
do so only with the permission and in accordance with the instructions of 
the Township. 

 
  All curb painting shall be in addition to the display of numbers listed above. 

Any person(s) soliciting for curb painting shall first obtain a Township solic-
iting permit, as well as prior approval of the Township. Commercial contrac-
tors may be required to produce evidence of liability and workers’ compensa-
tion insurance coverage. 

 
 I. Section 602.3. Insert: “September 1 to May 1, where appropriate.” 
 
 J. Section 602.4. Insert: “September 1 to May 1, where appropriate.” 
 
(Ord. 207, 6/15/2004, §2) 
 
 
§5-803. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. 
 
Any ordinance of East Rockhill Township in conflict herewith is hereby repealed. 
 
(Ord. 207, 6/15/2004, §3) 
 
 
§5-804. Savings Clause. 
 
Nothing in this Part or in the International Property Maintenance Code hereby adopted 
shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights 
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, un-
der any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in §5-802 of this Part; nor shall any 
just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Part. 
 
(Ord. 207, 6/15/2004, §4) 
 



  (5, PART 9) 
 

9/11/2012 5-43 
 

PART 9 
 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 
 

 
§5-901. Election to Enforce the Pennsylvania Construction Code Act. 
 
East Rockhill Township, Bucks County, Pennsylvania, hereby elects to administer and 
enforce the provisions of the Pennsylvania Construction Code Act, Act 45 of 1999, 35 
P.S. §§7210.101 — 7210.1103, as amended from time to time, and its regulations. 
 
(Ord. 206, 6/15/2004, §1) 
 
 
§5-902. Adoption of the Building Code. 
 
The Uniform Construction Code, contained within Title 34 Pa. Code, Chapters 401 — 
405, as amended from time to time, is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by refer-
ence as the municipal building code for East Rockhill Township, Bucks County, Penn-
sylvania. 
 
(Ord. 206, 6/15/2004, §2) 
 
 
§5-903. Administration and Enforcement Provisions. 
 
Administration and enforcement of the code within East Rockhill Township shall be un-
dertaken, as determined by the Board of Supervisors for East Rockhill Township, Bucks 
County, Pennsylvania, in accordance with the regulations of the Pennsylvania Con-
struction Code Act. 
 
(Ord. 206, 6/15/2004, §3) 
 
 
§5-904. Building Code Board of Appeals. 
 
1. Creation of Appeals Board. A Building Code Board of Appeals (hereinafter “Ap-

peals Board”) is hereby established in conformity with the requirements of the 
Pennsylvania Construction Code Act, Act 45 of 1999, 35 P.S. §§7210.101 – 
7210.1103, §501(c) and Title 34 Pa. Code, §403.121. The Appeals Board shall hear 
and rule on appeals, requests for variances and requests for extensions of time. 

 
2. Appointment of Members. The Appeals Board shall consist of five members ap-

pointed by the Board of Supervisors as follows: one member shall be appointed to 
serve a five-year term; one member shall serve a four-year term; one member 
shall serve a three-year term; one member shall serve a two-year term; and one 
member shall serve a one-year term. After the initial appointments, each new 
member shall serve for five years or until a successor has been appointed. 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-44 9/11/2012 
 

 
3. Qualifications of Members. The members of the Appeals Board shall, in the dis-

cretion of the Board of Supervisors, be qualified by training and experience to pass 
on matters pertaining to building construction. Training and experience may con-
sist of licensure as an architect or engineer, experience in the construction indus-
try, or training or experience as an inspector or plan reviewer. No member of the 
Board of Supervisors nor any code inspector employed by the Township may serve 
on the Appeals Board. If the Board of Supervisors is unable to find a sufficient 
number of qualified individuals who reside within the Township, it may appoint a 
qualified person who resides outside of the Township to fill a position. 

 
4. Alternate Members. The Board of Supervisors shall appoint two alternate mem-

bers who shall be called by the Appeals Board Chairperson to hear appeals in the 
event of the absence or disqualification of a member. Alternate members shall 
possess the qualifications required for Board membership and shall be appointed 
for five years or until a successor has been appointed. 

 
5. Intergovernmental Cooperation. The Board of Supervisors is hereby authorized to 

enter into an intergovernmental cooperation agreement with one or more munici-
palities to create an Appeals Board. 

 
6. Chairperson and Secretary. The Appeals Board shall annually select one of its 

members to serve as Chairperson and Secretary. The Secretary shall file a de-
tailed record of all proceedings in the office of the Township Manager. 

 
7. Disqualification of Member. A member of the Appeals Board shall not hear an ap-

peal in which that member has any personal, professional or financial interest. 
 
8. Operation of Board of Appeals. The procedure for conduct of hearings and notices 

of hearings shall be established by resolution of the Board of Supervisors and 
shall be consistent with Pennsylvania law and regulations of the Pennsylvania 
Department of Labor and Industry. 

 
(Ord. 206, 6/15/2004, §4) 
 
 
§5-905. Existing Ordinances. 
 
1. All ordinances and/or resolutions or parts thereof which have previously been 

adopted by East Rockhill Township on or before July 1, 1999, and which are equal 
to or exceed the requirements of the code shall remain in full force and effect until 
such time as the provisions of those ordinances fail to equal or exceed the mini-
mum requirements of the code, as amended from time to time. Those ordinance 
provisions which are hereby saved from repeal include but are not limited to: 

 
 A. Ordinance 136, adopted March 21, 1991, note especially Article II, §B(5) 

and(6), which establishes the requirement of submission of grading plans 



  (5, PART 9) 
 

9/11/2012 5-45 
 

and site plans for review by the Township Engineer and the Building In-
spector. 

 
 B. All provisions of Ordinance 136 and the codes adopted thereunder which 

equal or exceed the minimum requirements of the code. 
 
 C. Ordinance 136, which establishes the office of the Building Inspector and 

sets forth requirements for permits and inspections. 
 
2. All ordinances and/or resolutions or parts thereof which have previously been 

adopted by East Rockhill Township that are in effect as of the effective date of this 
Part and whose requirements are less than the minimum requirements of the 
code are hereby amended to conform with the comparable provisions of the code. 

 
3. All other ordinances, resolutions, regulations and policies of East Rockhill Town-

ship not governed by the code shall remain in full force and effect. 
 
(Ord. 206, 6/15/2004, §5; as amended by Ord. 207, 6/15/2004) 
 
 
§5-906. Changes to the Code. 
 
This code may be changed and/or modified by the Board of Supervisors of East Rockhill 
Township in accordance with the Pennsylvania Construction Code Act, Act 45 of 1999, 
35 P.S. §§7210.101 – 7210.1103, §503. 
 
(Ord. 206, 6/15/2004, §7) 
 
 
§5-907. Fee Schedule. 
 
A fee schedule assessable by East Rockhill Township for the administration and en-
forcement undertaken pursuant to this Part and the code shall be established by the 
Board of Supervisors of East Rockhill Township by resolution from time to time. 
 
(Ord. 206, 6/15/2004, §7) 
 
 
§5-908. Changes to the Amendable Sections of the Labor and Industry Regulations. 
 
In accordance with §403.102(1) of Title 34, Part XIV, Chapter 403, the following regula-
tions set forth in the Pennsylvania Code are amended as set forth below: 
 
 A. Section 403.43(g). Delete the words “five years” and replace with the words 

“one year.” 
 



CODE ENFORCEMENT 

 5-46 9/11/2012 
 

 B. Section 403.43(h). The permit holder shall keep a copy of the permit on the 
work site until the completion of the construction or the issuance of a use 
and occupancy permit, whichever comes later. 

 
 C. Section 403.62(c)(1)(xvii). Deleted in its entirety. 
 
 D. Section 403.64(d). Delete Numbers (1) through (4) and replace with the fol-

lowing: 
 
  (1) Footing. 
 
  (2) Foundation/damp proofing/drain tile. 
 
  (3) Backfill inspection. 
 
  (4) Plumbing, mechanical and electrical system inspection. 
 
  (5) Framing and masonry inspection. 
 
  (6) Fire stopping. 
 
 E. 34 Pa. Code §403.82. Hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

A building code official shall follow the following procedures if an inspection 
of an occupied building reveals a violation of the Uniform Construction 
Code: 

 
  (1) A construction code official shall discuss the inspection results with 

the permit holder at the completion of the inspection. 
 
  (2) The building code official may issue a written notice of violations to 

the permit holder. The notice is to contain a description of the viola-
tions and an order requiring correction of the violations within a rea-
sonable period determined by the building code official. When a viola-
tion relates to an unsafe building, structure or equipment, a building 
code official shall act in accordance with §403.84 (relating to unsafe 
building, structure or equipment). 

 
  (3) After the compliance date contained in the order, the building code 

official shall inspect the building, structure or equipment to determine 
whether the violation was corrected. The building code official shall 
close the order if the violation was corrected. The building code official 
may issue an order to show cause under §403.83 (relating to order to 
show cause/order to vacate) to the owner for a violation that was not 
corrected. 

 
(Ord. 206, 6/15/2004, §8) 
 



  (5, PART 9) 
 

9/11/2012 5-47 
 

 
§5-909. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. 
 
All other ordinances and/or resolutions or parts thereof which are in conflict with this 
Part are hereby repealed. 
 
(Ord. 206, 6/15/2004, §9) 
 
 
§5-910. Saving Clause. 
 
Nothing in this Part or in the code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit 
or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or 
any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby 
repealed as cited in §5-909 of this Part, nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any 
character be lost, impaired or affected by this Part. 
 
(Ord. 206, 6/15/2004, §10) 
 





  (5, PART 10) 
 

9/11/2012 5-49 
 

PART 10 

CERTAIN LICENSES REQUIRED 

§ 5-1001. License and Fee Required for Plumbers Working Within the Township. 

1. No plumbing contractor and/or individual offering plumbing services to others 
and/or the general public shall be allowed to perform plumbing services within 
East Rockhill Township or be issued a permit to conduct such plumbing services 
without first providing the Township of East Rockhill a copy of his/her current 
professional plumbing license from an accepted testing authority and proof of 
his/her registration with the State of Pennsylvania, in accordance with the appli-
cable professional codes, including but not limited to the International Plumbing 
Code, as amended and adopted through the UCC, and the provisions of the previ-
ously adopted BOCA National Plumbing Code that have been saved from repeal 
and that are still in effect. 

2. All plumbing contractors and/or individuals offering plumbing services to others 
and/or the general public within East Rockhill Township shall be required to reg-
ister with and receive a license from the Township of East Rockhill on an annual 
basis and be required to pay an annual fee related thereto, as set by the Town-
ship’s Fee Schedule Resolution. Plumbing contractors and/or individuals offering 
plumbing services to others and/or the general public that fail to pay the requisite 
fee and properly register with and receive a license from the Township shall be 
prohibited from performing plumbing services within East Rockhill Township in 
accordance with the applicable professional codes set forth herein. 

3. Every plumbing license issued by the Township shall be for a period ending on the 
31st day of the next December following the issuance of the license and shall not 
be transferable. The following shall be required of the plumber applicant prior to 
the Township issuing the requisite license: 

 A. Copy of a professional plumbing license from a Township-accepted testing 
authority and proof of registration with the State of Pennsylvania; 

 B. Acceptable insurance coverage; and 

 C. Any additional information the Township may require. 

(Ord. 261, 4/19/2011) 


