REPUBLIC SERVICES INC (ALLIED WASTE/BFI)

A - No Incentive Program
Monthly flat fee + Per

Option 1

Units bid

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

Year 4 - Township Option

Year 5- Township Option

J.P. MASCARO & SONS INC
Option 1

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

Year 4 - Township Option

Year 5- Township Option

Per Dwelling
Unit/month

Weekly Unlimitted

Service

$20.10

$20.70

$21.32

$21.96

$22.62

2012-2014 with Option Years

Bag

East Rockhill Township

Trash Recycling Bid
Trash District

Weekly Pay Per Bag

Service

A - No Incentive Program

Weekly Unlimitted

Service

$33.19

$33.79

$34.89

$35.79

$36.99

INNERSTATE WASTE SERVICES (CHES-MONT)
A - No Incentive Program

Option 1

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

Year 4 - Township Option

Year 5- Township Option

Weekly Unlimitted

Service

$23.90

$24.60

$25.35

$26.10

$26.90

$18.50
$0.25
$19.10
$0.25
$19.72
$0.25
$20.36
$0.25
$21.02
$0.25

Weekly Pay Per Bag

Service

$12.00
$3.50
$12.50
$3.50
$13.00
$3.50
$13.50
$3.75
$14.00
$4.00

Weekly Pay Per Bag

Service

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

B - With Recycling Incenstive Program

Per Dwelling Unit/Month

Weekly Unlimitted Base Service
with Recycling Incentive Program

$20.10

$20.70

$21.32

$21.96

$22.62

Monthly flat fee + Per Bag

Weekly Pay Per Bag Service with
Recycling Incentive Program

$18.50
$0.25
$19.10
$0.25
$19.72
$0.25
$20.36
$0.25
$21.02
$0.25

B - With Recycling Incenstive Program

Weekly Unlimitted Base Service
with Recycling Incentive Program

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Weekly Pay Per Bag Service with
Recycling Incentive Program

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

B - With Recycling Incenstive Program

Weekly Unlimitted Base Service
with Recycling Incentive Program

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Weekly Pay Per Bag Service with
Recycling Incentive Program

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid



